Teegt de g TEe-23004/99 30 REGD.NO. D. L-330(04/59

Che Gazette of Iudia

EXTRAORDINARY
i [1—avs 3—39-E'=  {ii)
PART II—Sectinn 3—Sub-section (ii)

miasER ¥ wHifyw
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T Teeell, Y@ AN, T 5, 2006/3WTE 15, 1928
No, 455] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, MAY 5, 2006/VAISAKHA 15, 1928

giftrg &Y FEm FHEa
( S ifa el gl fawm)
S
72 fawe], 5 718, 2006
FLAL 657(F).—Uge Frm, 2003 31 iR WEEE @ & fog sfivg P 5
wrew, Uoe wRfmE, 1970 (1970 @1 20) @ U 150 FW1 ¥Ed Wil & 5O @0 BY W &
JEH, IEERY, W 2 @S 3, ouds (i), mow 20 REw 2006 § W WHR & Aftrey ¥
Teinr warer (aiEnfis iR ot dads fawm) @ sftga do F0sn0 1844(3), Tl 20 BEE
2005 & 3 yeide B v @ fed W Wl afdear § Ree ool mafdd R & W
& ou wdre B, R vE v o, R sl e € shml s o sues e @
of, & fom ot arafy o warf@ @ o andm ofw gema Wil ¢ 4 |
alfe Sa ARYET ae TowE @ A, 2 SEd, 2006 W1 SR @1 SN UG T
o ;
afie o g e & aw 3 o @ A andd ofie gendl W duE wReR BN faaw
v form T €
3/, a6, e e Gee Fam 1970 (1970 &1 39) @ €W 159 FN Weq Wikl @
w6 gY, e Fraw, 2008 ¥ ol W @ @ fag et Fam T g e -

1. (1) 3 Fgwi & wlera T 4de (deem) 799, 2006 € |
(2) & vz 3 wewreE @) AR B EEd 8 |
2. dee Frm, 2003 § (R g gue gvaw @ Frw sw mn ) Pem s o sufam (1)
-
(@) w@s (i) % “uw a9, 65 3l 125 & el sl § B =l R sl @1 A
f&m W |
(@) @ (i) @1 & & s |
3. et Tl @ 6 & wufem (1) 3 wgs & e G s |

1374 GL2006 (1)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXT RADRDINARY [P [—Sec 3(iH))

{ﬂﬁﬂ$ﬁﬂﬁ?$¥ﬂﬁﬂﬂ{2}ﬂ—

(@) We (@) # “wwe vE & wwaw, U goRgRe wem ¥ aw sdnenfa fey
S | "

(@ e (@) 7 “ow @ v s O eew v @ W) gEl @ @ e
ST |

(M) s (M & e e AeEfaiee @ @ o, s -
“m) el el swRaw ® de ¥ o ¢l 99y § 98l SR @ e g

v & e
aw i & P 10 i wedis # Sfm T v % e W PE, eE A e
w& W |

e fre & faam 12 9 —
(@)  wufm (19) o Wt A, “dA A T B W I T, CBE A U
T

(@  wulm Q) 4 <dE A IR § 'MW OEE W e W o
(m) sl (3) § <0 e T @ = W CeE A wE v e |
e Frm & P 24 3 Frfalen wge e s, sl —
q 9% sl e fiey FdFs e &1 oFa § N YT, weEe: S
e o gty &) o 9 v Ao e 248 & e wene & Ay e e @i
anE ¥ e " e 7
oo Fam 24| M-
@  wufe (1) #-
(i) @ (i) & e W FEtaien g@s e o, s -
“ uR 1@ B A TR @ R o ow @ aEe @ gfda
= akg | A1 AEET BEd By oF @ arg 9 9§ v
Fsarery A @ dae, gy 18 # fm w7
() @3 (i) @ we o Peafafes ge e o, s -

“fi) o7 sml, fme dav g 11 @ SwEN (3) & I e
fay aFpm fem oen & yfiew @ aea @ AR An
FeddE AW I e BEA T B qWE A sdeie A
B

(i) @ (i) 3 wm w Pt ds war wem, s -

“(iif) amnaaﬁmﬂm{@ﬁaﬁﬁqm%maﬁurgﬁamaﬁ
ariiE W W e FIEe BY @Y A W TSy A & T
a7 T B & afideor oF ol 9 gE A @ oW W 9
TR B, T wm

(iv) @ (iv) & wm W Freaffea d@s war oo, s :—".

[k it ]



[ 1—TEvE 3(ii) ] T TS ¢ SR

L

“iv) ORI 16 BT SHERT (3) & WIS & IR HEe fa
ﬂqaﬁaﬁaﬁuﬁmaﬁmaﬁﬂﬂ,mmﬂaﬂﬁaﬁmﬁ
21 wers aftig e @) ofdem @ ala B asareda T @ Hiw
1 3 e Wigd B @1 ane § vE We & ey w0 yed
w1, T w7
(v) E‘:f:{v}ﬂ_“mﬂmﬂﬂa?amhmﬁﬁﬁaaw"ma’imaﬁ?:ﬂmﬁ
WE WS (e (vime) sfRfioE, 2008 @ e @ g EW 118 &
sl AR & o v Ses, OF A0 SET W W |
(@)  wufEm (2) 94—
(i) we () & wiF w P @ wE e, s -
“f)  wT et & e # e when & R el oE Y E @R
safy, Rres fiav Fress e o AP T s swEel ol
s @ Rt won, G e NEeHE B aiE s
o U @ ey oM &9 @ adla § ue e, ool
yEETE) &), BN
W?@Wﬁémaﬁﬁﬁmm_ﬁﬂﬁ@ﬁmﬁ}a%
it e wEa w0
(ii) e (i) & e, Pl @ smwnfa fEm o, SR -

“(iii) = ol fowe iy Frise Waw @ RO @ Foem s,
amE FrEs g Rl o & omiE @ g 9w A
2 (7

[ s (3) 4 gus mige affed w7 weEl @ WE W “gud HifEgd
aftveat @Y, wEEn e & B arRn e @ @ a0 1 gE A A AR
o aidE ¥ Y AW @ R o o gvERE &), e ' W

(@ ovfan () & wm o RreEfeRe Sefm e s, sl -

“(4) wmﬁaﬁﬁm%a{lﬁﬂiﬁmﬁﬁﬁaﬂﬂﬁﬁmﬁmﬁm
T, S A W, foreT STl 1 SiIeE B B fHU T &1 e
T alfiees @1 Wi T o & 9vE HrE BT (7

9. qaﬁﬂa#ﬁwﬁzﬁﬁ“h}”aﬁmﬁaﬁﬂ#agmsﬂuﬂmml

10. @ Pl & o 6 B ke @ eriaial” 98 B WE W® Pl @ wan =g,
H -

“irge & st A el wriaRar;
11, ¥o el & Ao 65 3
(B)() e e B e W Prefeien ured i T o, sEiq -
“(1) tde W fad I,
() SR (1) & e ug Pl Suf v o, s

“(1) oW 25 B SHERI (1) & i fady e & Tore amndes wiffan eiie
ﬁmmmmw?Wﬂﬁmﬁqmmmw.




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Part I—Sec. 3(ii)]

12,

13.

14.

15.

186.

7.

18.

afe B B, T gHaE & fry, R W aer A v 2 e off wEfee
w00 |

(1)  wuF (1) A afafde fd 9@ @ @0 g0 of) B b g 1@ @ anfle
ST o Wt @1 A | 9E W @ waft @ wnf@ @ ud seee a9
g
(@) wuFaEn (3) 9 U9 gHE @) omaEe @ I W & wE W Y9Y w @t
AIIH N YA, TR I o vy & e e e
(m S (4) ¥ 9 A wEl B i W A e e W
el sl & Fam 559 ¥ g 25 @) Gvaw (3)” W, @) of ProE @ W 9 “ar
25 Hl SuER (2)" we 3iF Al Sras W@ o |
e il & e 56 -
(@  SuFw (1) 4 “Rdy ) g v & e W “RoE ssd @ el fe @
GUAr W, 3 N SwEw v o '
(@) wuFEg (4) # ‘a9 25 T SR (4)”° wEl 3T iR Pred W W AN 25
W U (3)"” e 3 AN Ered W |
e Pl & P 71 & 9 (2) & i W Prafafies st wan o, sl —

“2) T v e e PdEs, el T Sl @ siaeH & Wafte s @
amel & Raw, sufem (1) & sdn B e arie 1 Aem s, |
UHT SR SR F T a0 A I v @ smf @ e G smem

o B & o 74 @ wm W Preafafae B e e, g -

“74, UlE H W —

(1) e 0¥ Suwl e, O wee w8 o e anifa @),
ditedt syl A wenfRFfe e A Qe sl o Fam a7 @ adA ande
@ fory &t e aifd @l |

(2) e wAE, WETET OR 43 @ aRfiA Ude se fhy W o 9
o o & diter and fea wg |

@ Pt & Fam se 4, “ygifen 297 sl “qgie” ve & wiE W 39w w o
d 3 8 “arEr W v 9 |
o Bl & Faw134 & aef (1) 96—
@) s (@) & v Feliiea g sm-enfa e omgn, smiq
“{mw) & amr g & sl gE e BRE 3 0 £ 0
(@ =8 (oA v IE $ WH W mEe uba U5 @ o |

el Pl & Frm 108 @ SuRtE (1) 8 “Fm 20, Fram 56 ek B so(13) 3 v
3], Dro@l 3R R & = W R 2w, R ss & Sufm (6) s Bowoeo &
SUHEH (19) 3 um i, BN 3 Slew W S |



[ +1F1 11— 3(ii) ] WTTR T AT ¢ SETEE

19,

20.

21.

aper Frai ot gl SEE A -

(@) e wES 4 oo Sud dfE pRfed & W W mfafie me ot wlafed &
S, ari

ur 53(2) af =W 142(4), From 13(). 4 200 uf = 1200 wfy =TE";

80(1%) 3 130 & I WU B fawol

& fo srdE w

(@ W wEnm 12 & w2 ¥ P oaw” W dw ofi R @ WF W “Fa
oaT” e, 3t Al e W |

T Pl ot qud arqadl A
(i) w1 W —
@ o @ () @ SR (@) i g W B W, G
(afRsrEm) & R e T A

(@) o=y e o e 9 ST T E
(i)  wem 4§ “2a@a)(i)” I, e 3T Sred! ® al fHu S
(i) B ue § e 9 AaTIHal 6 b

(iv) w7 HW'ZE{E} sl sl MR Ares & WA W R 26(2)" 9E
3w Bras W WA

(v} mgﬁ,ﬁmzﬁ“ﬁma’smmﬁq e B wE W TSR 3e
Wl e T A
(vi) W18 H—
(@) ﬁﬂ1ﬁ,#&{m$ﬂﬁﬁﬁfﬁmﬂﬁﬁhﬂwlﬁ,m:—
“E) . TR MBS il AT $ were o A [
() Rt e T GeEA @) aTEal T E
(vii) fo=dt e 3 el @Y InaEE W E
(vil) w9 26 H—
(&) a1 o are Y Wi A wel &1 e e e
(@) Fugo & wie G PR feuTr T W, s
‘Rroqor-() S @ A B, I9 FEE ;

(@) oo @ fory wwell SR <hag
ﬂﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁﬂmaﬂﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁﬂﬁwﬁ&ﬁiﬁﬂﬁﬂ‘ﬁmﬁ:—
e Sl
(Frm 74 SHEN)

1274 afr"f/d{-a_



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Part [—Sec 361 [V L

TEE &1 U

UG RN

) o s AR

BIEA T B TR it i

wmiftrd e € O UEE @ owdEd aEes W Jumslea |
. G e & fag ﬁ%ﬁaﬂﬁm

1970 B TN B SR AT AHE oo 00 D AV T T 3R B RAY FoT
Frea fvm wm 2 | ;
R CE k. — e P
(eriery T )

froqur .—gw 9¥e & Adieew & AU B, IR T T W AN B e, 200

B! i 9w geam oS 94 9 fe g g )

1. 5. 14/2/2005- ﬂ’#mn;ugrﬁ]
T, U, W, TR w5

R - g Fram ura @ wems A afgen o Foan 403(x), TNE 2 #E, 2003 F A
T v Uy & v aerwEg sRgE o FI0am0 1418(a), dNiE 28 fHEY 2004 g HETEG
f&T T

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE AND INDUSTRY
(Department of Industrial Policy and Promotion)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 3th May, 2006
8.0.657(E).—WHEREAS a drafi of certain rules further to amend the Patents Rules,
2003 was published in exercise of the power conferred by section 159 of the Patents
Act, 1970 (39 of 1970) vide notification of the Government of India in Ministry of
Commerce and Industry (Department of Industrial Policy and Promotion) vide
Number SO. 1844(E) dated the 30" December, 2003, in Part II section 3, sub-section
(ii) of the Gazette of India, (Extraordinary) dated 30" December, 2005 for inviting
objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby before expiry of
a period of thirty days from the date on which copies of the Gazette containing the
Notification were made available to the public;

AND WHEREAS the copies of the Gazette containing the said Notification
were made available to the public on 2™ January, 2006: i



o, 3¢ [T —EvE 3(ii)] A T IS ¢ AEHET

|

AND WHEREAS objections and suggestions received from the public on the

said draft rules have been considered by the Central Government;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred t:-'y section 159 of the
Patents Act, 1970 (39 of 1970), Central Government hereby makes the following rules
further to amend the Patents Rules, 2003, namely: -

3

Lt

(1) These rules may be called the Patents (Amendment) Rules, 2006.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official
Gazette.
In the Patents Rules, 2003 (hereinafier referred to as the principal rules), in
rule 4, in sub-rule (1),
{a) inclauses (i), the words and figures “other than under sections 39.65 and
125" shall be omitted.
(b) clause (ii) shall be omitted
In rule 6 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), the proviso shall be omitted;
In rule 7 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (2).- '
(a) in clause (a), after the words “paid in cash”, the words “or through
electronic means™ shall be inserted:
(b) in clause (b). the words “within the time allowed for payment of the
fees™ shall be omitted:;
(c) for clause (c). the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
*(c) Where a fee is payable in respect of a document, the entire fee
shall accompany the document.™;
In rule 10 and in the explanation of the principal rules, for the words “three
months”, the words “six months” shall respectively be substituted;
In rule 12 of the principal rules, -
~ (a) in rule (1A) and in the explanation, for the words “three months”™, the
words “six months” shall respectively be substituted:;
(b) in rule (2), for the words “three months”, the words “'six months™ shall
be substituted:
(¢) in rule (3), for the words “three months”, the words “six months™ shall
be substituted:
In rule 24 of the principal rules, the following proviso shall be added, namely:-
“Provided that the period within which the Controller shall publish the
application in the Journal shall ordinarily be one month from the date of
expiry of said period, or one month from the date of request for publication
under rule 24A.™;
In rule 24B of the principal rules, -
{a) in sub-rule (1), -
(i) in clause (i), for the words “after the publication of the application
but within thirty-six months”, the words “within forty-eight months”
shall be substituted;
(ii) for clause (ii), following clause shall be substituted, namely: -
“(ii) The period within which the request for examination under
sub-section (3) of section 11B to be made shall be forty-eight
months from the date of priority, if applicable, or forty-eight
months from the date of filing of the application;
(iii) for clause (iii), following clause shall be substituted, namely:



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Pk [I—Sec. 3(ii)]

9,

10.

“(1ii) The request for examination under sub-section (4) of section 11B
shall be made within forty-eight months from the date of priority or
form the date of filing of the a plication, or within six mo=ths from the
date of revocation of the secrecy direction, whichever is later;

(iv) for clause (iv), following clause shall be substituted, namely:

““{iv) The request for examination of application as filed according to

the ‘Explanation’ under sub-section (3) of section 16 shall be made
within forty-eight months from the date of filing of the application or
from the date of priority of the first mentioned application or within six
months from the date of filing of the further application, whichever is
later:

(v) in clause (v) for the words, figures and letter “the period specified
under the section 11B or”, the words, figures and letter “the period
specified under the section 11B before the commencement of the
Patents (Amendment) Act. 2005 or” shall be substituted,;

(b) in sub- rule (2),-

(1) for clause (i), the following clause shall be substituted, namely: -
(1) The period within which the Controller shall refer the
application and specification and other documents to the
examiner in respect of the applications where the request for
examination has been received shall ordinarily be one month
from the date its publication or one month from the date of the
request for examination whichever is later:

Provided that such reference shall be made in order in which
the request is filed under sub-rule (1),

(i) after clause (ii). the following clause shall be inserted, namely: -
*(iii) the period within which the Controller shall dispose off
the report of the examiner shall ordinarily be one month from
the date of the receipt of the such report by the Controller.”;

(¢) in sub rule (3), for the words “his authorised agent”, the words “his

authorised agent ordinarily within six months from the date of the
request for examination or six months from date of publication
whichever is later.” shall be substituted:

(d) for sub-rule (4), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely; -

“(4) The time for putting an application in order for grant under section
21 shall be twelve months from the date on which the first statement of
objection is issued to the applicant to comply with the requirements.”

in r;ulu 26 of the principal rules, the figure and brackets “(1)” shall be omitted:

In Chapter VI of the principal rules, for the heading “OPPOSITION
PROCEEDINGS”, the following heading shall be substituted, namely: -
“ OPPOSITION PROCEEDINGS TO GRANT OF PATENT ™

[



[ s [l—2 3(ii)] S =7 T ¢ ST

le

11. In rule 55 of the principal rules-
(a) (i) for the marginal heading, the following marginal heading shall be
substituted, namely:-
“(1) Opposition to the patent.”;

(ii) for sub-rule (1), the following sub-rules shall be substituted, namely:-
“(1) Representation for opposition under sub-section (1) of section 25
<hall be filed at the appropriate office and shall include a statement and
evidence, if any. in support of the representation and a request for
hearing if so desired.

(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-rule(1), no patent
shall be granted before the expiry of a period of six months from the
date of publication of the application under section 1TA.
(b) in sub-rule(3), for the word, waffect”, the words, “effect alongwith a copy
of such representation” shall be substituted;
(c) in sub rule (4), for the words “one month” the words “three months.” shall
be substituted,

12. In rule 55A of the principal rules, for the words, figures and brackets “sub-section
(3) of section 257, the words, figures and brackets “sub-scetion (2) of section 257
chall be substituted;

13. In rule 36 of the principal rules, -

{a) in sub rule (1). for the words “notice of opposition™, the words, figures and

letter “notice of opposition under rule 55A” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-rule (4), for the words, figures and brackets “sub-section (4) of
section 257, the words, figures and brackets “sub-section (3) of section 237
shall be substituted;

14, In rule 71 of the principal rules. far sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall
be substituted, namely: -

“(2) The time within which the Controller dispose of the request made
under sub-rule (1), except in case of inventions relating to defence and
atomic energy applications, shall ordinarily be within a period of
twenty one days from the date of filing of such request.™;
15. For rule 74 of the principal rules, the following rule shall be substituted.
namely: -
“74, Form of patent:-
(1) A patent shall be in the form as speci fied in the Third Schedule with
such modifications as the circumstances of each case may require and shall
bear the number aceorded to the application under rule 37
(2) The patent certificate shall ordinarily be issued within seven days from
the date of grant of patent ander section 43.
16. In rule 88 of the principal rules. the word “sealing”. ocourring at both the
places. the word “grant”, shall be substituted;
17. In rule 134 of the principal rules. in sub rule (1). -
(a) after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely: -
“(aa) as to when the information under section 8 has been filed.™:

(b) in clause (k), for the words “Official Gazette”, the words “Official
Journal™ shall be substituted;

1374 ‘:’L?ﬂé -2



10

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Parrt I—Sec. 3(ii)]

18. In rule 138 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), for the words, figures and
brackets “in the rules 24,55 and 80(1A)”. the words, figures and brackets “in
the rules 24B, sub-rule (4) of rule 55 and sub-rule (1A) of rule 80 shall be
substituted; ¥

19. In the THE FIRST SCHEDULE of the principal rules, -

(a) for items number 4 and entries relating thereto, the following item and
entries shall be substituted, namely:-

l?}n request for c:i{t-:nsiun of 4 300 1.200
time under sections 53(2) -
and 142(4), rules 13(6), per month per month™

80(1A) and 130,

(b) in item number 12, in column 2. for the word figure and letter “rule
23B”, the word figure and letter “rule 24A™ shall be substituted, -

20, In the THE SECOND SCHEDULE of the principal rules,-
(i) in Form 1-
(a) in para 9, in item (i), in sub-item (b) for the word *“Signature(s)”.the

words “Signature(s) of the inventor(s)” shall be substituted;
(b) after para 10, for the words “The Controller of Patent”, the words “The

Controller of Patents™ shall be substituted:
(ii) in Form 4, omit words figures and brackets “24B(4)(11),”
(iii) in Form 35, after Para 4, for the words “The Controller of Patent”, the
words “The Controller of Patents” shall be substituted:
(iv) in Form 7, for the words bracket and figure “See sections 25(3)” the
words bracket and figure “See section 25(2)" shall be substituted;
(v)in Form 9, in Para 2, for the words “application for Patent No., the words
“Patent application No.” shall be substituted:
(vi) in Form 18, -
(a) in Para 1, after item (c¢), the following item shall be added, namely:
“(d) date of publication of the application under section:
By 7 T ..
(b) after Para 4, for the words “The Controller of Patent”, the words
“The Controller of Patents” shall be substituted.:
(vii) in Form 21, in Para 1, for the words “patent No./No.”, the words “Patent
No.” shall be substituted:

(viii) in Form 25,



[ |m I—a&vE 3(ii)] A 1 TE9H SR

(a) the words “No Fee”, occurring in the beginning shall be
omitted:
(b)for the Note, the following Note shall be substituted, namely:-
“ Note — (a) Strike out whichever is not applicable
(b) For fee see first schedule.™;
21. For THE THIRD SCHEDULE of the principal rules, the following Schedule
shall be substituted, namely:-

*“THE THIRD SCHEDULE
(Refer rule 74)
FORM OF PATENT
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA

Patent Mo .oiiiins sivmmmane:

Application NO. .. ccoewiscemesis e

| BE 1T ) BT o1 S S —
Inventor(s) (Where applicable)..........ooov

It is hereby certified that a patent has been granied to the patentee for an
TOVEREON  ENLIEA. . .o vemerrennrennsnrsnnssns narssrarssnsnanesbosss sds iz i saiion
as disclosed in the above mentioned application for the term of 20 years from
the......... day of..ceeiennrennn 19/20..........., in accordance with the
provisions of the Patents Act. 1970.

Date of Grant-----—--- Controller of Patents
© (Seal of the Office)
Note. — The fees for renewal of this patent, if it is to be maintained, will fall
o 11 () | RS « - 1+ .. 20..... and on the same day in every year
thereafier.”.

[F. No. 14/2/2005-PP & C]
N. N. PRASAD, Ji. Secy.
Note:— The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India vide
Notification number S.0. 493 (E) dated the 2™ May, 2003 and subsequently
amended vide notification No. S.0. 1418(E) dated 28™ December, 2004,

Prinied by the Manager, Govi, of India Press, Ring Rond, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Conlroller of Publications, Dethi-110054,



